

Freedom of Information Request No. 5049

Received 7/1/2019

Responded 29/1/2019

Request/Response

The following Information regarding the use of consultants by the council (ie. Anyone taken in from an outside body to advise the authority on any matter).

A) The number of consultants used by the council in

1) 2018

2) 2017

3) 2016

B) The cost to the council of the use of consultants in

1) 2018

2) 2017

3) 2016

C) A breakdown by project and hours worked of the number of consultants used by the council in

1) 2018

2) 2017

3) 2016

2018			
Number of consultants	Cost of Consultants	Number of Projects	Number of Hours Worked
38	107,749	Not recorded on financial system	Not recorded on financial system

2017			
Number of consultants	Cost of Consultants	Number of Projects	Number of Hours Worked
26	154,688	Not recorded on financial system	Not recorded on financial system

2016			
Number of consultants	Cost of Consultants	Number of Projects	Number of Hours Worked
34	211,301	Not recorded on financial system	Not recorded on financial system