Freedom of Information Request No. 5432

Received 25/9/2019

Responded 27/9/2019

Request/Response

1. How many Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation cases are currently receiving Housing Benefit?

93

2. How many Specified General Supported Accommodation cases are currently receiving Housing Benefit? 10

3. How many Specified Domestic Violence Hostel cases are currently receiving Housing Benefit?

3

4. How many Specified Local Authority Hostel cases are currently receiving Housing Benefit?

Λ

5. What is the highest eligible gross rent being paid for a Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation case by Housing Benefits? £227.30 per week (this is the HB paid, not necessarily the eligible rent amount)

6. What is the lowest eligible gross rent being paid for a Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation case by Housing Benefits?

£76.10 per week. (this is the HB paid, not necessarily the rent eligible rent amount)

7. What is the lowest core rent being paid for a Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation case by Housing Benefits? Information not available - We do not hold the core rent on our system, only rent

payable amounts, plus information regarding amounts ineligible for Housing Benefit.

8. What is the highest core rent being paid for a Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation case by Housing Benefits?

Information not available - We do not hold the core rent on our system, only rent payable amounts, plus information regarding amounts ineligible for Housing Benefit.

9. How many Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation cases are currently receiving Housing Benefit for the following eligible rent ranges: £150.00 per week eligible gross -£250.00 per week eligible?

55

£251.00 per week eligible gross - £300.00 per week eligible gross?

£301.00 per week eligible gross - £400.00 per week eligible gross?

Greater than £400.00 per week eligible gross?

0

10. How many Specified General or Exempt Supported Accommodation cases have been referred to the Rent Officer service (VOA)?0 of the Current cases

11. How many Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation cases are being paid where the Local Authority is only receiving 60% subsidy?0

12. How many Specified Exempt Supported Accommodation claims have received an 'unreasonably high' rent decision? -

N/A – none of the current cases were referred to the Rent Service.