

Freedom of Information Request No. 5460

Received 24/10/2019

Responded 21/11/2019

Request/Response

1. Do you conduct an audit or have figures relating to the number of trees that your authority has responsibility for? If so please provide me with a figure for the number of trees at the nearest date you have to (a) 1.4.19 and (b) 1.4.16 - **No accurate figures available. Trees in parks and open spaces are recorded but trees in hedgerows, countryside areas and woodlands are not.**
2. How many trees that you have responsibility for were felled by either your employees or contractors working on behalf of your authority in (a) 2016-17, (b) 2017-18 and (c) 2018-19?
2016 – 17 = 48
2017 – 18 = 30
2018 – 19 = 36
3. How many trees for which you have responsibility were planted by your employees or contractors working on behalf of your authority in (a) 2016-17, (b) 2017-18 and (c) 2018-19?
2016 – 2017 = 31
2017 – 2018 = 11
2018 – 2019 = 22
4. How many trees in your authority were subject to a Tree Preservation Order as at (a) 1.4.19, and (b) 1.4.16? **We do not hold this information**
5. How many trees subject to a Tree Preservation Order were felled in the 18-19 financial year? Please provide me with a list showing the number of each species involved – **We do not hold this information.**