

## Freedom of Information Request No. 6154

Received 16/2/2021

Responded 22/3/2021

### Request/Response

1. With regard to the authority's housing waiting list, how many households were removed from the list in the last full year where figures are available?

184

2. Can you list the reasons given for the removal from the list? Data not held

3. How many households were removed from the list because of death? Data not held

4. How many households have been on the list for a) between five years and ten years  
b) ten years or more

2019 - 783

2018 - 382

2017 - 725

2016 - 848

2015 - 1081

2014 - 1056

2013 - 708

2012 - 776

2011 - 623

5. With regards to household that has been on the list the longest, how long have they been on the list? 22 years

6. Can you provide the same figures provided for questions 1. 2. and 3 for each of the last ten years or as far back as the cost limit will allow? Data not held